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Th e global economic outlook has become increasingly 
uncertain since the U.S. November presidential elec-
tions. Unfolding U.S. trade, economic and foreign pol-
icies under the new Trump Administration, have left  
companies and  U.S. trading partners scrambling over 
the implications of the many new policies and rule 
changes. More broadly, the consensus is that importers 
will be paying higher duties (tariff s) on foreign sourced 
goods to the U.S. Treasury upon entry. Th is will likely 
drive prices upwards, spike infl ation and slow spending.

U.S. infl ation in January rose to 3% year-on year, up 
from 2.7% previously. With global and foreign exchange 
markets focusing strongly on U.S. protectionism, the 
Canadian dollar, the euro, Mexican peso, Brazil’s real- 
are among some of the impacted currencies. Th e U.S is 

deploying tariff s to tackle a wide range of issues from 
immigration to national security to overreliance on im-
ports for production. Th e U.S is the largest importer of 
goods and services, buying $1.1 trillion worth in 2024, 
surpassing Chinese imports of 2.6 trillion by a wide mar-
gin. As such, higher barriers to its trade disrupt global 
supply chains and investment.

U.S. targeted trade with China, Canada and Mexico im-
mediately and imposed tariff s on steel and aluminum 
imports globally. Th is should weigh on currencies over 
the coming months. Th e specter of tariff s has helped 
spark a sell-off  in bonds on infl ation fears, pushing the 
dollar higher and currencies of Asian emerging markets 
lower. It has weighed on some equity markets such as 
India and Malaysia. 

Overview
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Once in eff ect, 25% tariff s on aluminum and steel will 
impact higher prices on a wide range of goods, across 
sectors including autos, machinery, construction, semi-
conductors, aerospace, infrastructure, homes, retail and 
manufacturing. Th e eff ects will be felt across countries 
and regions at varying levels. Given the close integration 
of the global economy only a few countries will escape 
the likely eff ects of tariff s and trade wars.

Th e record of recent tariff s proves that the duties do not 
magically create jobs in the U.S. Manufacturing as a share 
of U.S. employment has fallen since the fi rst Trump ad-
ministration. Companies in industries directly protected 
by tariff s in the Trump fi rst term-notably steel and alu-
minum-did increase their revenues. But that gain came 
at the expense of thousands of downstream companies 
that suff ered from higher input costs. Th e earlier tariff s 
did nothing to reduce the U.S. trade defi cits. One reason 
is that they tend to strengthen the dollar. Tariff s are sup-
posed to reduce U.S. demand for imported goods, lead-
ing to less demand for foreign currencies. But when few-
er dollars are sold, the greenback’s value increases, which 
in turn depresses global demand for U.S. exports. Th e 
result is that even as Americans buy less from abroad, 
they sell less to foreigners.

Th e current proposed trade barriers are much more tar-
geted than was promised on the campaign trail. Th e 25% 
tariff s on aluminum and steel are steep but they are not 
the biggest items on the list of U.S. imports.

Th e pushback of plans for what the U.S describes as re-
ciprocal tariff s until April also signal less extensive ac-
tion than had been feared. Moreover, the 10% tariff s on 
China is much less than the 60% threatened. Th is points 
to a worsening U.S.-China relations on trade and invest-
ment, though not a complete breakdown.

Anticipation of tariff s has boosted the dollar. Th at will 
hurt smaller, more export-dependent economies, and 
other U.S. trading partners as well. Th ere are no reasons 
to believe that higher tariff s will increase profi table at 

U.S. companies. If tariff s are negotiating tools, not a re-
curring threat that keep CEOs guessing when to place 
orders or where to build factories- they will need to be 
short. Instead of fretting about tariff s, investors should be 
looking for opportunities in those countries that stand to 
gain from probable shift s. Emerging market economies 
in Asia outside of China should be on the list.

While China is likely to compete more aggressively for 
the trade pie outside the U.S., those countries that want 
to benefi t from disrupted global supply chains should see 
growth as they did aft er trade frictions started in the fi rst 
Trump term. Vietnam is the big example. From 2017-
2023, Vietnam increased its export share to the U.S. in 
all product categories., making it a winner among Asia’s 
emerging economies. Th is growth is not merely a result 
of China rerouting its exports under the guise of Viet-
namese goods but stems from Vietnam’s hard-earned 
progress.  Vietnam’s trade linkages have expanded sig-
nifi cantly across the globe, spanning China, the U.S., 
north Asia, the EU and the Asean group of 10 countries. 
Th is performance mirrors the rapid increase of foreign 
direct investment over the past two decades. Vietnam 
has outperformed the rest of the region in attracting 
FDI, drawing infl ows from South Korea, Singapore, Ja-
pan Hong Kong, Taiwan and the U.S.

Despite mounting uncertainties, the U.S. economy is 
still a standout. Th e IMF estimates that 2024 U.S. GDP 
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growth was 2.8% and expects similar growth in 2025. 
Th at compares with 0.8% growth in the eurozone and 
0.3% in Japan. Th e U.S. is giving itself multiple tools to 
impose whatever tariff s it likes for whatever reason it can 
make up on a highly fl exible, legal basis, with a series of 
arbitrary and eminently mutable deadlines. 

On top of tariff s, it already has on China, the U.S. now has 
25% fentanyl-and-immigration tariff s now due on Cana-
da and Mexico eff ective March 4; across-the-board steel 
and aluminum tariff s due on March 12; and the “recip-
rocal” tariff s, to be discussed in light of various reports 
President Trump has commissioned for April 1. Addi-
tiona tariff s on autos, pharmaceuticals and semiconduc-
tors are next in line.  Th e assembly of tariff  weaponry 
appears largely designed to create negotiating leverage 
for concessions and mark a new era and a shift  away 
from the U.S. domestic rules-based system. Th e U.S. has 
moved toward full-scale protectionism for its industries. 
It is also willing to use tariff s and blocks on imports as 
a coercive tool of foreign policy.  Th e aim is to get more 
companies to move manufacturing to the U.S.  

Th is U.S. generalized global trade war against the rest of 
the world puts trade relationships at a new and uncertain 
stage.  If the U.S. genuinely tries to close its overall trade 
defi cit with big tariff s, this will likely cause a recession. 
For some economies, this shock to global trade provides 
a chance to bolster resilience, liberalize trade access and 

improve competitiveness. Amid higher trade friction 
and volatility, capital is seeking eager hosts. Some coun-
tries in Asia-Malaysia, Vietnam, Singapore and India for 
example-are positioning themselves to be winners in the 
trade war.

Europe 
Western capitals are braced for potential decisions on 
European security, as the U.S. and Russia begin talks to 
end the war in Ukraine and European hold emergency 
meetings to respond to the fast-moving negotiations tak-
ing place without them.
Th e region’s top leaders gathered in Paris for talks on 
Ukraine and the future of European defense, as the U.S. 
opened peace talks with Russia in Saudi Arabia. Th e 
Europeans were not invited to the talks. Neither was 
Ukraine.

Th is underscores the Europeans’ lack of input into ne-
gotiations that could ultimately reshape the continent’s 
security architecture. Leaders from the UK, Germany, 
Poland and heads of EU institutions and NATO huddled 
in Paris for an emergency meeting at the invitation of the 
French President. Joined by the heads of governments 
of Italy, Spain, the Netherlands and Denmark, they dis-
cussed concrete plans aimed at safeguarding European 
defense regardless of future U.S. engagement. Th e coun-
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tries examined how best to support Ukraine and how to 
strengthen their negotiating position.

Th e Russians responded to the U.S. decision to open talks 
as a “powerful signal that we will try to solve problems 
through dialogue and talk about peace rather than war.”

Tough European emissions rules are forcing car man-
ufacturers to sell more electric vehicles, which are less 
profi table. In China, the rise of local competition is 
bringing the curtain down on a golden era for German 
brands. 

Th ere is great disruption. Th ere are already thousands of 
job losses and with higher U.S. tariff s, risks infl icting fur-
ther damage on Europe’s economy, which has struggled 
to grow as fast as the U.S. in recent years. Th e automotive 
industry accounts for roughly 7% of GDP product in the 
European Union—far higher than in the U.S.

Volkswagen, the region’s bellwether automaker, reported 
record profi t last year, but its stock now trades at 14-year 
lows. It is holding talks with its labor union about clos-
ing factories in Germany.  VW workers held a so-called 
warning strike in protest. Volkswagen exemplifi es the 
unfolding crisis.

Europe’s second-largest carmaker, Stellantis, said its 
Chief Executive Offi  cer would leave, amid mounting 
tensions with suppliers and politicians. In January Ford’s 
European operation announced 4,000 job cuts. Big in-
dustry suppliers such as Bosch and ZF Friedrichshafen 
are also laying off  thousands of workers each. Europe-
an carmakers planned for a rapid adoption of electric 
vehicles, spurred by regulators. But aft er an early burst 
of enthusiasm, consumers have not cooperated, wary of 
high prices and patchy charging infrastructure. Subsi-
dies were withdrawn last December in Germany, hitting 
Europe’s largest EV market hard.

Starting next year, carmakers will have to sell many more 
EVs or hybrids in the EU to comply with new limits on 
carbon-dioxide emissions, or else pay fi nes. In the U.K., 
manufacturers face heft y penalties if EVs account for 
less than 22% of their sales this year. VW has privately 
warned that it might have to pay EU fi nes of up to $1.6 
billion.

Th e U.K. government last week hinted it could relax its 
emission rules, and some analysts expect the EU to fol-
low suit. Th e uncertainty is perilous for an industry that 
relies on a high level of demand planning to coordinate 
long supply chains.

Even without the technology shift , Europe’s car industry 
would be struggling. Sales in the region are running al-
most a fi ft h below pre-pandemic levels aft er a period of 
high infl ation that priced less-affl  uent buyers out of the 
new-vehicle market. Production costs have been rising, 
particularly in Germany, which lost its supply of cheap 
Russian gas amid the war in Ukraine. Th is year, the com-
bined profi t of VW, Mercedes-Benz and BMW is expect-
ed to fall by a third. Only a modest recovery seems likely 
in 2026.

Another challenge is rising competition in Europe from 
Chinese EVs, which are oft en cheaper. While additional 
EU tariff s this year have slowed the European expansion 
plans of companies such as BYD, the policy is encourag-
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ing them to build new factories in the trade bloc.

Exports, a traditional strength of Europe’s luxury car-
makers, haven’t made up for a smaller, more crowded 
home market. Expectations are for vehicle shipments 
from Europe to total 2.7 million this year, 16% lower 
than in 2019.

China has long been a lucrative export market for top-
of-the-range cars, but this year demand has been hit by 
a broader slowdown in luxury spending. Mercedes-Benz 
and BMW issued profi t warnings in September, citing 
the weak Chinese market among other reasons. It could 
get worse: China has fl oated extra taxes on imported gas-
oline vehicles as a potential response to the EU tariff s.

New U.S. tariff s will only add to the pressure. Th is isn’t 
just about shipments from Europe: VW, Audi, Mer-
cedes-Benz and BMW also manufacture products in 
Mexico for the U.S. Th e U.S. imposed a 25% tariff  on 
goods imported from Mexico. Th ose duties are currently 
on a temporary hold.

Th e vulnerabilities noted are a dramatic turnaround for 
an industry that was an outsize winner from the falling 
trade barriers of the 1990s and 2000s. Europe emerged 
from the 2008 fi nancial crisis with a global lead in au-
tomotive production and technology. Even aft er China 
took the production crown, Europe’s car industry re-
mained robust, accounting for almost a quarter of global 
light-vehicle output in the years before the pandemic. 
Th is year, its share is expected to fall to 19%, far behind 
China at 33% and not much above North America, ac-
cording to S&P Global’s forecasts.

Meanwhile, EVs have handed the technological lead to 
the U.S. and increasingly China. Chinese companies 
used to pay VW for its engine know-how; now it is pay-
ing startups like Xpeng in China and Rivian in the U.S.  
for EV expertise.

Manufacturing orders in Germany rose in December 

on aerospace demand, although any tentative signs of a 
recovery for the struggling industrial sector face the im-
minent threat of tariff s from the U.S. European steel and 
aluminum and manufacturing sectors, among others, 
already under energy cost pressures and weak domes-
tic demand, face a rough 2025-26. Global demand could 
contract, as higher tariff s drive up costs and consumers 
spend less.

Canada
Canada has warned it will impose “tit-for-tat” tariff s on 
U.S. products such as steel and orange juice if the U.S. 
goes ahead with his threat to impose high duties on Ca-
nadian imports.

Canada’s energy & natural resources Minister assures 
that Canada wants to co-operate with the U.S. on facing 
down China. However, he says Canada would not stand 
by if the U.S. imposed potentially devastating tariff s on 
its exports. Th ese retaliatory tariff s would focus on prod-
ucts that would create “the greatest amount of angst in 
the United States with the least amount of pain in Can-
ada” — potentially steel from Michigan or orange juice 
from Florida. 

Th e U.S. threat to impose a 25% tariff  on all Canadian 
exports to the U.S. has been placed on temporary hold. 
Canada is the largest exporter of steel and aluminum to 
the U.S.

Th e Canadians say they are open to new co-operation 
with Washington, including potentially buying subma-
rines and other military equipment, and developing 
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more critical mineral projects in Canada that would 
displace Chinese products from U.S. supply chains. 
Th ere are opportunities for Canada to procure a lot of 
the go-forward military equipment, like the submarines 
from the U.S. Canada remain s open to that prospect as 
part of a broader conversation. A fi ght over tariff s was 
a “distraction” from more pressing issues, according to 
the Canadian energy minister. “Th e challenge we face in-
ternationally right now, it’s not Canada-U.S., it’s China,” 
he stated. China is known to have strategic control of a 
several assets, and particularly critical minerals. 

Th e Canadian desire is for the two North American al-
lies to build an energy and minerals security partnership 
or alliance that enables both countries to contribute to 
having more availability of raw materials and technology 
to support future growth. In January, China banned the 
export of several rare earths to the U.S. in an escalation 
of the technology war. 

China controls most of the supply chain for rare earths, 
which are critical inputs for advanced clean energy and 
defense technologies. Th e Canadian energy minister 
visited Washington, met with Republican politicians, in-
dustry representatives and other stakeholders — as part 
of Ottawa’s lobbying eff ort to persuade the U.S. govern-
ment to not impose tariff s on Canada. Th ese tariff s, if 

implemented, could tip Canada’s economy into reces-
sion. 

Th e U.S. administration proposed 25% tariff s on all im-
ports from Mexico and Canada, accusing the U.S.’s clos-
est neighbors of failing to tackle illegal migration and 
drug traffi  cking. Justin Trudeau, Canada’s prime minis-
ter, responds that nothing is off  the table in terms of a 
response to U.S. tariff s. 

Th e premier of Canada’s oil-rich western province Al-
berta, who met with President Trump, articulated she 
did not agree to any potential export tariff s on Canadian 
energy or other products, or any ban on exports to the 
U.S. While Canadian government offi  cials continue to 
publicly and privately fl oat the idea of cutting off  energy 
supply to the U.S. and imposing export tariff s on Alber-
ta energy and other products to the U.S. -these moves 
are not in the best interest of Alberta. Until these threats 
cease, Alberta says it would not fully support the Cana-
dian government’s plan in dealing with the threatened 
tariff s. Th e U.S. and Canadian economies are deeply in-
tertwined. Canada’s oil industry supplies more than half 
of U.S. crude imports, and Washington has invested tens 
of millions of dollars in Canadian critical mineral proj-
ects to reduce reliance on Chinese imports. 
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U.S. tariff s on Canadian imports would hurt U.S. con-
sumers as well as Canadians, pushing up the price of gas, 
timber and other vital goods. In addition to crude, steel 
and aluminum the U.S. imports potash, uranium, critical 
minerals and timber from Canada.

Furthermore, U.S. President Trump says he is consider-
ing the use of “economic force” to annex Canada, for na-
tional security reasons. Canadians are agitated by these 
declarations, which has led to a groundswell of nation-
alism in Canada. Th ere is boycotting of U.S. goods and 
cancelling of vacations in the U.S. Fact is, a vast majority 
of Canadians have no interest in becoming Americans.
Th e U.S president’s insistence that Canada should join 
the U.S. has stood out, triggering a mix of outrage and 
confusion, as the Canadian government struggles to 
work out the best strategy to deal with the new U.S. de-
mands.

According to reports those in the Trump circle insist 
that the president’s designs on Canada are serious. Th e 
annexation of Canada is said to centered on a strategic 
defense plan for North America. Th e plan is said to be 
tied to the demand for control over Greenland and the 
Panama Canal, to give the U.S. a dominant security posi-

tion stretching the length of the continent.

Th e strategy, the new Great Game of the 21st century is 
focused on the arctic region. Th e strategic advantage of 
the region, make it central in the great U.S. power strug-
gle with China and Russia. What’s beneath the arctic 
surface, is also considered as rich -minerals, rare earth, 
energy potential -in which the U.S. intends to be very 
involved. Formerly, Canda’s most secure part was its 
northern border in the Arctic. Th at area is now consid-
ered the most vulnerable. It is described as Canada’s “soft  
underbelly”.

Canada’s Prime Minister Trudeau who has resigned ef-
fective March 4, 2025, has suggested stepping up defense 
co-operation with the U.S., announcing a C$38.6 billion 
plan to modernize North American Aerospace Defense 
Command (NORAD) capabilities over two decades; and 
pledged to spend C$1.3 billion to beef up border se-
curity, as well as creating a fentanyl tsar to tackle drug 
smuggling across the border. With PM Trudeau stepping 
aside the big challenge for Canadian voters is to elect the 
person best suited to negotiate with the U.S. and stick up 
for Canada’s interests during this extra-ordinary testing 
time for the country. 

Canada has traditionally off ered a low-risk operating 
environment which is equivalent to a B rating. Canada 
rates as low risk in most categories, including fi nancial 
risk, government eff ectiveness risk and infrastructure 
risk. Th e macroeconomic environment and tax policy 
are by far the highest risk categories. Th e economy has 
so far shown reasonable resilience amid above-neutral 
interest rates, and the expectation a fi rm momentum as 
the Bank of Canada (BoC, the central bank) gradually 
lowers interest rates in the remainder of the 2025-26 out-
look period. 

Th e Canadian economy faces signifi cant downside risk 
due to new economic, trade and foreign policies in the 
U.S. Th e Canadian economy is closely interlinked with 
the U.S. It is highly exposed to changes in U.S. industri-
al, foreign and economic policies. Th e labor market risk 
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will likely rise due to high potential for industrial action, 
although these risks are generally manageable. We be-
lieve both countries will continue to trade – even if the 
current environment causes disruptions and confusion.

Turkey
Economically, Turkey faces several challenges. Still, with 
GDP growth at 4% and consistent lira strengthening 
over the past year, confi dence has begun to return. Th is 
follows 4.5% GDP expansion in 2023. Growth could be-
gin to slow in the coming years, if global demand slows. 
Turkey struggles with high infl ation-down to 46% at the 
end of 2024. Infl ation rates peaked at 85% in 2022. Th e 
Central Bank implemented a series of interest rate hikes, 
bringing the policy rate to 50% by March 2024. Th ese 
measures have contributed to a decline in infl ation to 
44.38% in January 2025. Th e Central Bank reduced the 
benchmark interest rate to 45%, signaling a cautious ap-
proach to monetary easing. Th e target is 21% for 2025 
but this seems ambitious. 

Th e Central Bank’s tight monetary stance has enabled 
Turkish authorities to stabilize the lira, reduce infl ation, 
rebuild FX reserves, and de-dollarize the fi nancial sys-
tem. Turkey’s savings gap with the rest of the world has 
narrowed, registered a decline in the current- account 
defi cit by 4 percentage points of GDP since 2022. Tur-
key has recorded improved external buff ers over the past 
year; International reserves rose by $14 billion to $155 
billion in 2024, and their risk composition improved sig-
nifi cantly. 

Since unwinding foreign exchange swaps with local 
banks, the Turkish central bank’s net foreign assets (ex-
cluding FX swaps) rose from minus $75 million to $39 
billion in early 2025- due to reduced fi nancial dollar-
ization and demand for foreign, capital infl ows and in-
creased access to external borrowing. 

Positive real interest rates, low current-account defi cits 
and improved capital infl ows will support durability and 
support improvements in Turkey’s external buff ers. 
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Th e country will be able to service its foreign debt obli-
gations in 2025, with the IMF agreement allowing close 
monitoring by the Fund. Th e forecast is that Turkey will 
maintain comfortably FX reserve coverage broadly in 
line with its peers over the next 12 months. Reserves are 
projected to rise to $175 billion by 2026, equivalent to 
4.8 months of current external payments.

Monetary policy remains defensive, so household con-
sumption and fi xed capital investment are expected to 
remain constrained in 2025. President Erdogan and the 
authorities now expected to take steps to prevent domes-
tic demand from slumping, while promoting more ex-
ports, foreign capital infl ows, plus trade and investments.
Banks are maintaining relatively strong credit expansion 
while the Turkish government keep public sector wage 
growth and transfers elevated, allowing the fi scal budget 
to widen, keeping GDP growth at around 2.7% in 2025.  
Th e government will continue seeking loans and inter-
national funding, including from the Gulf states. 

Turkey has sold cheap steel to the U.S. Th e 25% tariff s 
imposed on all steel imports will likely dissuade Turkish 
producers from seeking to sell in the U.S. market. Th ey 
will be seeking alternatives to the U.S. market and that 
could be a challenge in the current environment.

Turkey’s normalization of relations with Egypt and Saudi 
Arabia is progressing. Th e Turkish leader continues to 

balance his country’s NATO, EU and U.S. relationship 
with his economic, strategic relationship with Russia.
Turkey’s foreign policy is partly driven by its need to im-
prove energy security, specifi cally for gas, for which it is 
heavily import dependent. Russia’s supply of discount-
ed gas continue to be a key pillar of support to Turkey’s 
economy.

Th e May 2024 halt on bilateral trade with Israel will 
eventually be negotiated- providing that Israel enables 
continuous and “adequate” humanitarian aid into Gaza. 
Transshipments of Azerbaijani oil to Israel via Turkey 
are still halted. 

Terrorism risks in Turkey remain elevated, demonstrat-
ed by an October 23, 2024, Kurdistan Workers Party 
(“PKK”) attack on Turkish Aerospace Industries. Kurd-
ish and jihadist militants have intent but signifi cantly re-
duced capabilities to carry out complex attacks in major 
cities- Istanbul and Ankara. Attacks appear unlikely to 
return to pre-2017 scale and frequency. 
Pro-Kurdish politicians have engaged with imprisoned 
Kurdish leaders, including the leader of the PKK. Th ese 
talks aim to resolve the decades-long confl ict between 
the Turkish state and Kurdish militants. 

India
Th e Indian Prime Minister Narendra Modi met with 
U.S. President Trump in early February and agreed to in-
crease imports of U.S. oil and liquifi ed natural gas (LNG) 
by India. Th is is seen as an eff ort to rebalance the two 
countries’ trade relationship. Russia is currently the main 
supplier of crude to India, while Qatar is the biggest pro-
vider of LNG. Th e commitment by India followed U.S. 
complaints of India as an abuser of tariff s while threat-
ening to impose reciprocal tariff s. Th e new initiative has 
the potential to expand the market for U.S. suppliers. Ac-
cording to one of India’s top natural gas importers, this 
is a time of more benign prices for U.S. gas exports and 
India is ready to import more LNG from the U.S. 
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Th e International Energy Agency said India’s natural gas 
consumption will increase by nearly 60% by 2030, with 
LNG imports set to more than double in the same peri-
od driven by steady demand growth and a much slower 
rise in domestic production. In 2023, India’s total net gas 
production met just about half of its demand. India has 
much appetite for more energy. Th erefore, there is po-
tential for India to buy more LNG from diff erent sources.
Doing business in India carries moderate risks. Th e rul-
ing coalition, led by the Bharatiya Janata Party (BJP), 
won the 2024 general election, which has aided politi-
cal stability, but its narrow parliamentary majority may 
cause some policy uncertainty related to certain business 
reforms. 

Strong demand for goods and services and increasing 
purchasing power will continue to make India an ap-
pealing market. A young demographic, technological 
progress and strong growth momentum will underpin 
India’s attractiveness for foreign fi rms, although chal-
lenges associated with employment generation and cli-
mate change will weigh on medium-term potential. 

Th e government has prioritized infrastructure spending, 
focusing on telecommunications, transport, logistics, 
energy and defense. Eff orts to attract foreign manufac-
turing companies to India has been moderately success-
ful, although remaining behind Southeast Asian peers. 
Th e country’s robust economic momentum will mitigate 
some macroeconomic risks. India will sign more bilater-
al free-trade agreements (FTAs) in 2025-26. Public debt 
levels are high but manageable, as most of the debt is 
held domestically.

With GDP growth currently at 6.4%, the slowest since 
the pandemic eff orts to bring in more foreign investment 
will be boosted in 2025. Companies in India will be as-
sessing the impact of slower growth on their investments 
and the outlook for consumption; as well as government 
budgetary proposals aimed at spurring growth -which 
would impact the business environment. 

Microsoft  is among many foreign corporations that are 

increasingly considering investment in India. While the 
country is still short of enough highly skilled technical 
researchers and quantum engineers, etc., interest has 
grown in India as an alternative manufacturing, assem-
bly and servicing location that can rival China.

Microsoft ’s chief executive recently took a whirlwind 
tour of India and left  a trail of gift s behind. Th ey includ-
ed a $3 billion planned investment over the next two 
years. Funds are to be used mostly for developing artifi -
cial intelligence and cloud services under Azure, Micro-
soft ’s cloud computing platform. Funds will also be used 
for training 10 million Indians in AI skills by 2030. Th e 
company described this as the single largest expansion 
that Microsoft  has ever done in India.

Th ere is optimism over the level of AI development ac-
tivity currently taking place in India. Approximately 
17,000 Indian developers are on GitHub, a platform that 
allows developers to create, store and share their code, 
which Microsoft  acquired in 2028.India is expected to 
become the largest community of GitHub by 2028. In-
dian developers are working on more than 3,500 gener-
ative AI projects.  

Technology companies  in the U.S. are expecting remov-
al of regulatory shackles under the Trump administra-
tion. Th is will allow them to stay ahead of China. Some 
Indian companies are doing interesting work in AI, but 
there are no clear signs of signifi cant breakthroughs in 
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technology or product development that would launch 
India as leading global player. Nonetheless, the size of 
the Indian market and its demographics make this coun-
try prime for multinational investments and market ac-
cess going forward.

While Microsoft  is investing $3 billion in India, its global 
plans are to spend $80 billion in 2025 developing data 
centers globally, with more than half of that fi gure in-
vested in the U.S.

India has gained in export market share to the U.S. 
since 2017, but not by much. A “Make in India” drive by 
the Modi government, tax cuts and production incen-
tive schemes have helped, especially in the information 
technology sector. Still, manufacturing has not kept up 
with the country’s rapid growth, and its share of GDP 
declined to 14% in 2024 from 16.5% in 2014. Mr. Modi is 
trying to change that with pre-emptive lowering of tariff s 
on U.S. goods while boosting bilateral India-U.S. trade, 
investment and security ties. He is targeting further in-
vestment in sectors such as toys, footwear, and IT.

Colombia
In early February, President Gustavo Petro demanded 
that his entire cabinet resign. Th en, he fl ew to Dubai to 
give a speech on artifi cial intelligence and the threat it 
poses to “global civilization.”

Back home, Petro’s government was in disarray. New 
leadership has since been replaced in several key minis-
tries, including defense – even as fi erce battles between 
rebel groups in the country’s northeast have displaced at 
least 52,000 citizens.

Th e chaotic cabinet reshuffl  e – which followed a botched 
attempt by Petro to stand up to pressure over migration 
from the U.S. – has added to the isolation of Colombia’s 
president (and fi rst left ist leader) halfway through his 
term. Th e loss of confi dence in Petro’s leadership threat-
ens to worsen a security crisis in the U.S.’s backyard. 

With two years left  in his term, observers see little poten-
tial for the Petro Government to get much accomplished
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legislatively. Th e crisis was parked by Petro’s choice to 
appoint the scandal-ridden political operator Armando 
Benedetti as chief of staff , while promoting his 30-year-
old confi dante as foreign minister – despite her lack 
of foreign policy experience. Both individuals are em-
broiled in a campaign fi nance scandal that continues to 
roil the government.

Observers believe the appointments were made with an 
eye to presidential and legislative elections in May next 
year, in which Petro is barred from standing again but is 
seen as wishing to install a loyal successor to continue 
Colombia’s left ist experiment. Th e president is seen as 
focused on the 2026 election and that there be continu-
ity.

President Petro, a self-described revolutionary and pro-
lifi c social media user who spent years in opposition 
either side of a stint as mayor of Bogota, took offi  ce in 
2022 promising to overhaul the oil and coal exporter’s 
investor-friendly economic model while weaning the 
country off  fossil fuels. Since then, warring rebel groups 
and drug traffi  ckers expanded their presence in Colom-
bia – as President Petro plans for wide-ranging peace 
talks fl oundered.

Fiscal stability has come under heavy strain, in part due 
to increased spending and reduced tax take, while a ban 
on new fossil fuel exploration has led to growing reliance 
on imported natural gas. Foreign direct investment last 

year fell 17.6%.

In mid-February, the government levied a surprise 
1% tax on fossil fuel production -citing powers grant-
ed by emergency decrees in response to the fi ghting in 
Catatumbo in the country’s northeast. 

Th e Petro government has had some success in expand-
ing the state’s role in pensions, but attempts to reform 
health, education and labor laws have faced pushbacks 
in congress, where he declared the death of his left -of-
center coalition in April 2023.

Th e recent collapse of the president’s cabinet was trig-
gered by a rancorous televised six-hour cabinet meeting 
on February 4th that aimed to discuss the emergency in 
Catatumbo. In the meeting several front benchers-in-
cluding his Vice President-blasted Petro for installing 
the tarnished new chief of staff .

Th e mood had already been soured by the crisis in 
U.S.-Colombia relations aft er Petro rejected a U.S. mili-
tary fl ight carrying deported migrants in handcuff s. Pet-
ro eventually reversed himself, but the damage had been 
done. Colombia’s image aft er two-years under President 
Petro’s leadership has slipped and its previous close alli-
ance with the U.S. has taken a hit. Other leaders in the 
region have opted to take a far more cautious and concil-
iatory approach to the U.S. president.

Th e Colombian private sector and foreign investors in 
the country are looking forward to a successor to Pet-
ro. Most voters are similarly anxious about the country’s 
current leadership.   

Written by Byron M. Shoulton
Senior Global Economist 
FCIA Trade Credit & Political Risk Division
Great American Insurance Group
For questions / comments, please contact Byron at
bshoulton@fcia.com
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What is Trade Credit Insurance?

Companies selling products or services on credit terms 
or fi nancial institutions fi nancing those sales face the 
risk of non-payment by their buyers. 

Trade Credit Insurance provides a cost-eff ective mech-
anism for transferring that risk. FCIA’s Trade Credit In-
surance products protect the policyholders against losses 
resulting from that non-payment.

Why Trade Credit Insurance?

One of a company’s largest assets is their accounts re-
ceivable but they are oft en not insured. Th is could oft en 
be due to lack of knowledge of availability of coverage.

A debtor’s nonpayment can be caused by commercial 
events such as insolvency or protracted default. On in-
ternational transactions, nonpayment can also result 
from the occurrence of disruptive political events such 
as wars, government interventions, or currency incon-
vertibility.

A Few Value-Added Benefi ts For Insureds

FCIA’s Trade Credit Insurance policies off er companies a 
wide array of fl exible coverages. You can insure a broad 
multi-buyer receivable portfolio, a smaller select receiv-
able portfolio (key accounts), or a single buyer receiv-
able.
Some Value-Added Benefi ts of Trade Credit Insurance

    •    Sales expansion
    •    Ability to off er longer repayment terms
    •    Access to better fi nancing terms
    •    Reduce earnings volatility
    •    Reduce bad debt reserves  

Who Can Benefi t From Trade Credit Insurance?

Manufacturers & Distributors, Packaging, Energy, Phar-
ma, Mining, Commodity Traders, Metals, Technology, 
Financial Institutions,  Food & Beverages, and more.

To sign up for FCIA Major Country Risk Development  and 
more information on FCIA insurance coverages, please visit 
us at www.FCIA.com.

Although FCIA has made every eff ort to insure the accuracy of this publication we do not accept any responsibility whatsoever for - including but not limited to - errors, omissions, 
opinions or advice given. Th is publication is not a substitute for professional advice and all information is for guidance only.  Coverage descriptions in this brochure are summa-
rized. Consult the policy declarations and policy form for a full description of the applicable terms, conditions, limits and exclusions. Policies are underwritten by Great American 
Insurance Company, which is an authorized insurer in 50 states and the District of Columbia © Copyright 2024 by FCIA Trade Risk & Political Risk.  FCIA logo (letters and design) 
are registered service marks of Great American Insurance Company. All rights reserved.
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